
Never Satisfied  
Bill Brinkworth 

The people of Israel cried out 
because of their long bondage in 
the hands of the merciless Egyp-
tians, and God delivered them.  
As God physically led them to a 
place He would give them to 
live, they still were not content 
with seeing  the presence of the 
Almighty and His mighty deeds. 
They began to murmur and com-
plain again.   God was angered 
and sent a fire that consumed 
many (Numbers 11:1-2) because 
of their sin. Many died until the 
man of God pleaded for Him to 
stop His judgment. 

Did they learn their lesson? 
Two verses later, they let the sin 
of discontentment again get con-
trol.  They talked of all the good 
things they had in Egypt.  They 
licked their lips over the thoughts 
of the cucumbers, melons, leeks, 
onions, and garlic they had in 
Egypt. They just were not happy 
with what God had given them. 

It is not mentioned that they 
remembered the bad things in the 
land.  It  is   not   mentioned  that 
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The Unhappy Garden 
Author Unknown 

A story is told of a king who 
went into his garden one morning, 
and found everything withered 
and dying.  He asked an oak that 
stood near the gate what the trou-
ble was.  He found that it was sick 
of life and determined to die, be-
cause it was not tall and beautiful 
like the pine.  The pine was out of 
heart because it could not bear 
grapes like the vine.  The vine 
was going to throw its life away 
because it could not stand erect 
and have as fine fruit as the pome-
granate. 

So on throughout the garden it 
was.  Coming to a heartsease, the 
king found its bright face lifted up 
as full of cheer-
fulness as ever.  
Said the king, 
“Well, hearts-
ease, I am glad 
to find one brave 
little flower in 
this place of dis-
couragement and 
death.  You don’t seem one bit 
disheartened.” 
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Words to Find: 
eternal (Ps. 90:2) 
faithful (Ps. 89:1-2) 
good (Ps. 107:8) 
gracious (Ps. 111:4) 
infinite (Jer. 23:24) 
immutable (Heb. 13:8) 

just (Ps. 119:137) 
light (Ja. 1:17) 
love (John 3:16) 
merciful (Ps. 103:8-17) 
omnipotent (Gen. 18:14) 
omnipresent (Ps. 139:7) 
one (Is. 44:6-8) 

righteous (Ps. 119:137) 
selfexistent (Ex. 3:13-14) 
selfsufficient (Ps. 50:10) 
sovereign (Is. 46:9-11) 
spirit (Jn. 4:24) 
true (Jn. 17:3) 
wise (Pr. 3:19) 

Answers at: http://www.openthoumineeyes.com/Puzzles/GodIs.htm 

 

Contentment  

 Author Unknown 

A man who was contented and 
cheerful through a long period of 
trial was asked the secret of his 
contentment.  He said, “I will tell 
you.  I made the right use of my 
eyes.” 

“Please explain.” 
“Most willingly,” was the an-

swer. “First, I look up to Heaven 
and remember that my principal 

business is to get there. Then I 
look down upon the earth and 
think about how small a place I 
shall occupy when I am dead and 
buried.  Then I look around and 
see the many who are in all re-
spects much worse off than I am.” 

“Lastly, I learn where true 
happiness lies, where all our cares 
end, and how little reason I have 
to complain.” 
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they recalled their slavery, lack 
of religious freedom, lack of 
freedom to do what they 
wished, pain, misery, and suf-
fering.  All they could do was 
remember the “good times.” 

Sound familiar? Many get 
their lives changed when they get 
born-again.  God cleaned up 
many a dirty, ruined life.  Drunks 
and wife-beaters get changed to 
wonderful, respectable, sober, 
non-violent husbands. Liars and 
cheats have their lives com-
pletely changed, and their lives 
become lives of honesty.  Their 
character becomes forthright and 
outstanding. Criminal lives be-
come lives of outstanding citi-
zenship.  All lives become 
changed when they get saved.  
They may not be perfect, but 
they are not the same lives they 
had before they were saved.  
They have so much to be content 
with, but then discontentment 
rears its ugly head.  Complaining 
and dissatisfaction creep into 
their conversation.  Soon, they 
are no different than the children 
of Israel were.  They begin to 
lust for the “good ole days.” 

Let the truth be known!  
There were no good ole days.  
They were days that sowed sin, 
that you may be reaping to this 
day.  They were days of commit-
ting sin that scarred your life and 
hurt others around you. It is 

amazing how a mind can change 
the memory of a perilous past 
into something that seems far 
better than it was.  We do ex-
actly what the people of Israel 
did. 

To avoid non-productive 
murmuring and discouraging 
complaining here are some bibli-
cal truths that can help you 
avoid the downward spiral of 
those sins: 

  Remember that we are natu-
rally never satisfied. We always 
want more!  We have to get con-
trol of what the flesh desires and 
let the spirit of God do the guid-
ing. 
“Hell and destruction are 
never full; so the eyes of man 
are never satisfied.” 
                          Proverb 27:20 

  Let your thought-life and 
conversation never be about 
things you do not have or should 
not have.  Thinking and talking 
about them leads to the desire 
for the real things. 
“Let your conversation be 
without covetousness; and be 
content with such things as ye 
have: for he hath said, I will 
never leave thee, nor forsake 
thee.” Hebrews 13:5 

  Realize that the world and 
God owe you nothing.  Nothing 
this world has to offer is perma-
nent anyway!  Even that big 
house you have is only a pup-
tent, because, pilgrim, you are 
only passing through this life. 

“But godliness with content-
ment is great gain.  For we 
brought nothing into this world, 
and it is certain we can carry 
nothing out.” I Timothy 6:6-7 

  Be happy with what you have 
or what you are going through.  
No matter where you find your-
self; be content. 
“ Not that I speak in respect of 
want: for I have learned, in 
whatsoever state  I am, 
therewith to be content.  I know 
both how to be abased, and I 
know how to abound: every-
where and in all things I am 
instructed both to be full and to 
be hungry, both to abound and 
to suffer need.” Philippians 
4:11-12 

 

Anyone can complain.  It 
takes no intelligence or character 
to do so, but there never is any 
gain in doing so. Grumbling also 
will never make one happy or 
c h a n ge  a n y 
situation.  It will 
always make 
situations worse. 
However, being 
content and find-
ing peace in any 
situation will help you find your-
self happy with what you have 
and will guarantee a more happy, 
contented person. 

 

The Unhappy Garden 
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“No, your majesty.  I know I 
am of small account; but I con-
cluded you wanted a heartsease 
when you planted me.  If you had 
wanted an oak or a pine or vine 

or a pomegranate, you would 
have set one out.  So I am bound 
to be the best heartsease that ever 
I can.” 

 
When They Found 

Their Man 
  The Christian Evangelist 

 A story is told of a king who 
was suffering from a malady and 
was advised by his astrologist 
that he would be cured if the shirt 
of a contented man were brought 
for him to wear.  People went out 
to all parts of the kingdom after 
such a person.  After a long 
search they found a man who was 
really happy, but he did not pos-
sess a shirt. 

 
Be Yourself  
The Elim Evangel 

Do not spend your time in 
longing to be somebody else, to 
have his place, to do his work, to 
expect his gifts, and to speak in 
his way.  Be yourself!  God made 
you.  Respect your own individu-
ality.  If we are to enter into and 
to continue in God’s way for us, 
we must not have some little plan 
of our own.  Two people cannot 
be in control of one life at one 
and the same moment.  God has 
His way for you.  If you have a 
way for yourself, then your life is 
not under His control and cannot 
be until you surrender your pro-
gram and accept His.  

“A man's contentment is in his mind, not in the 
extent of his possessions.” — Spurgeon 

“… and be content 
with such things as ye 

have …”  — Hebrews 13:5 


